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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST



FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST 2021/24389


Dear Sir/Madam

Thank you for your recent request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) places two duties on public authorities.  Unless exemptions apply, the first duty at, Section 1(1) (a), is to confirm or deny whether the information specified in a request is held. The second duty at, Section1 (1) (b), is to disclose information that has been confirmed as being held. 

The information that you are seeking is in relation to the following:

REQUEST

1. The number of dog thefts reported to the force between April 1, 2020 and March 31, 2021.
1. How many of these reports have, so far, led to prosecutions. 
1. How many stolen dogs were recovered by the force between April 1, 2020 and March 31, 2021.
1. The number of dog thefts reported to the force in the previous 12 months, April 1, 2019 and March 31, 2020. 
1. How many of these reports have, so far, led to prosecutions. 
1. How many stolen dogs were recovered by the force between April 1, 2019 and March 31, 2020.


RESPONSE

1. 
	2020
	Month
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Neighbourhood
	January
	March
	April
	May
	June
	July
	August
	September
	October
	November
	December
	Grand Total

	Blaenau Gwent
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	1
	1
	 
	1
	 
	 
	3

	Caerphilly Central
	 
	
	
	
	
	
	1
	
	
	
	
	1

	Caerphilly North
	1
	
	
	
	1
	1
	1
	1
	
	
	
	5

	Caerphilly South
	 
	1
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	1

	Monmouthshire
	1
	1
	
	1
	
	
	
	1
	
	
	1
	5

	Newport East
	 
	
	
	
	1
	1
	1
	
	
	
	
	3

	Newport West
	1
	1
	
	1
	
	1
	
	
	
	
	
	4

	Torfaen
	 
	
	1
	
	
	
	1
	
	2
	1
	
	5

	Grand Total
	3
	3
	1
	2
	2
	4
	5
	2
	3
	1
	1
	27




	2021
	Month
	
	

	Neighbourhood
	February
	March
	Grand Total

	Caerphilly South
	1
	
	1

	Monmouthshire
	
	1
	1

	Newport West
	1
	1
	2

	Grand Total
	2
	2
	4



2. Prosecution data can be obtained from the courts as we do not hold this information.

3 & 6. 
The number of dogs were the animal was recorded as recovered in each of the following calendar years: 2016, 2017, 2018, 2019, and 2020.
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Found
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	Grand Total

	No
	9
	6
	7
	10
	12
	48

	Unknown
	
	2
	6
	8
	4
	21

	Yes
	11
	7
	10
	7
	11
	51

	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Grand Total
	20
	15
	23
	25
	27
	110




4. 
	2019
	Month
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 

	Neighbourhood
	January
	February
	April
	May
	June
	July
	August
	September
	October
	November
	December
	Grand Total

	Blaenau Gwent
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	1
	1
	 
	1
	3
	 
	6

	Caerphilly Central
	 
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	1
	1
	2

	Caerphilly North
	 
	
	
	
	1
	
	
	
	
	
	
	1

	Caerphilly South
	 
	
	1
	1
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	2

	Monmouthshire
	1
	
	
	
	1
	
	
	
	
	1
	
	3

	Newport East
	 
	1
	
	1
	2
	
	
	
	
	
	
	4

	Newport West
	 
	
	
	
	
	1
	1
	1
	
	
	
	3

	Torfaen
	1
	1
	2
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	4

	Grand Total
	2
	2
	3
	2
	4
	2
	2
	1
	1
	5
	1
	25



5. Prosecution data can be obtained from the courts as we do not hold this information.



Freedom of Information Act is a public disclosure regime, not a private regime. Any information disclosed under the Act is thereafter deemed to be in the public domain, and therefore freely available to the public and will be published on the Gwent Police website.

[bookmark: _Hlk74910960]If you are not satisfied, you have the right to request an internal review into the response that you have received, or, to complain about our handling of your request.


Thank you for your interest in Gwent Police.
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